

Garbage and Recycling Bids for 2024 - 2026

Bidder	Garbage			Curbside Large Item			Recycling			Total Price			
	1	2	3	Monthly	Bi-Monthly	Quarterly	Semi-annual	Annual	1	2	3	1	2

GFL	\$ 14.34	\$ 14.91	\$ 15.35	\$ 4.50	\$ 9.00	\$ 4.50	\$ 9.00		\$ 4.17	\$ 4.29	\$ 4.41	\$ 28.01	\$ 28.70	\$ 29.26
				Year 1	Year 2	Year 3	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3					
	Large Item Limitations: 1 hopper full													

Washler Inc.	\$ 14.07	\$ 14.50	\$ 15.08	\$ 10.08	**	\$ 3.96	\$ 1.68	\$ 0.84	\$ 6.84	\$ 7.04	\$ 7.32	\$ 30.99	\$ 31.92	\$ 33.19
				Year 1	Year 2	Year 3	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3					
	Large Item Limitations:													

Waste Management	\$ 13.23	\$ 13.89	\$ 14.58	\$ 10.38		\$ 3.46	\$ 1.73	\$ 0.86	\$ 8.50	\$ 8.93	\$ 9.38	\$ 21.73	\$ 22.82	\$ 23.96
	\$ 13.20	\$ 13.86	\$ 14.55	\$ 10.79		\$ 3.59	\$ 1.80	\$ 0.90						
	Monthly Large Item limited to two items per residence Semi-Monthly large item limited to two items per residence, 6 pickups per year *Did list alternative to curbside large item pickup													

Waste Mgt Alternative and stay with GFL for recycling Waste Mgt Alternative to Curbside Large Item	\$ 11.79	\$ 12.38	\$ 13.00						\$ 4.17	\$ 4.29	\$ 4.41	\$ 15.96	\$ 16.67	\$ 17.41
	(1) 40 yard dumpster per week staged at designated area													
Waste Mgt Alternative to Curbside Large Item	\$ 11.76	\$ 12.35	\$ 12.97						\$ 4.17	\$ 4.29	\$ 4.41	\$ 15.93	\$ 16.64	\$ 17.38
	(8) 40 yard dumpster per quarter staged at designated area													

Waste Mgt Alternative to Curbside Large Item	\$ 13.23	\$ 13.89	\$ 14.58	\$ 10.38		\$ 3.46	\$ 1.73	\$ 0.86	\$ 4.17	\$ 4.29	\$ 4.41	\$ 17.40	\$ 18.18	\$ 18.99
	\$ 13.20	\$ 13.86	\$ 14.55	\$ 10.79		\$ 3.59	\$ 1.80	\$ 0.90						
	Monthly Large Item limited to two items per residence Semi-Monthly large item limited to two items per residence, 6 pickups per year													

**Washler bid 24 large item pickups per year also, which is an additional \$20.16 year 1, \$20.76 year 2 and \$21.59 year 3.



Attachment 1, Page 1

GFL is pleased to offer you the following bid quote for your Residential waste and recycling services below as requested.

GFL will provide all necessary and proper equipment and manpower to collect, transport and dispose of all garbage and rubbish with 1—95-gallon cart per resident for the garbage collection with 1x per week service and 1-95 gallon recycle container to be serviced every week as requested.

1st Year 2024

Residential garbage Service - \$14.34 per month per household

835 Current Subscribers – \$11,973.90 per month, annually \$143,686.80

Recycle Service - \$4.17 per month per household.

835 Current Subscribers - \$3481.95 per month, annually \$41,783.40

Bulk Item options and rates are as follows:

Monthly Curbside Large Item Pickup - \$4.50 per month, with 1x per month service, Limited to 1 hopper full.

Semi-monthly curbside large item pickup- \$9.00 per month with 2x per month service , Limited to 1 hopper full.

Quarterly Curbside Large item pickup- \$4.50 per quarter, Service to be provided 1x per quarter, Limited to 1 hopper full.

Semi-Annual curbside large item pickup - \$9.00 - 2x per year, Service to be provided 2x per year, Limited to 1 hopper full.

Upon award GFL will provide a completion/Performance bond bid bond equivalent to 1 full year

Attachment 1, Page 2

Additional Services provided at no additional cost will include the following based on the bid request are below:

4-4yd container to be serviced 1xwk per week for the City of Butler with locations at the City Barn on Depot Street, Butler Police Department on West Main Street, Hathway Park on East Willow and Maxton Park on Green Street Extended.

15-96-gallon containers for garbage service for Butler Days Festival to be held the second weekend of August each year of the contract agreement.

Door pickup shall be made by the bidder for all disabled or handicapped residents. For the purpose of this paragraph, a person will be considered disabled if they are unable to carry their trash or garbage to the curb.

Year 2- 2025

Residential Garbage Service - \$14.91 per month per household

835 Current Subscribers – \$12,449.85 per month, annually \$149,398.20

Recycle Service - \$4.29 per month per household.

835 Current Subscribers - \$3582.15 per month, annually \$42,985.80

Bulk Item options are as follows:

Monthly Curbside Large Item Pickup - \$4.50 per month, with 1x per month service, Limited to 1 hopper full.

Semi-monthly curbside large item pickup- \$9.00 per month with 2x per month service , Limited to 1 hopper full.

Quarterly Curbside Large item pickup- \$4.50 per quarter, Service to be provided 1x per quarter, Limited to 1 hopper full.

Semi-Annual curbside large item pickup - \$9.00 - 2x per year, Service to be provided 2x per year, Limited to 1 hopper full.

Additional Services provided at no additional cost will include the following based on the bid request below:

4-4yd container to be serviced 1xwk per week for the City of Butler with locations at the City Barn on Depot Street, Butler Police Department on West Main Street, Hathway Park on East Willow and Maxton Park on Green Street Extended.

15-96-gallon containers for garbage service for Butler Days Festival to be held the second weekend of August each year of the contract agreement.

Attachment 1, Page 3

Residential Garbage Service - \$15.35 per month per household

835 Current Subscribers – \$12,817.25 per month, annually \$153,807.00

Recycle Service - \$4.41 per month per household.

835 Current Subscribers - \$3682.35 per month, annually \$44,188.20

Monthly Curbside Large Item Pickup - \$4.50 per month, with 1x per month service, Limited to 1 hopper full.

Semi-monthly curbside large item pickup- \$9.00 per month with 2x per month service , Limited to 1 hopper full.

Quarterly Curbside Large item pickup- \$4.50 per quarter, Service to be provided 1x per quarter, Limited to 1 hopper full.

Semi-Annual curbside large item pickup - \$9.00 - 2x per year, Service to be provided 2x per year, Limited to 1 hopper full.

Additional Services provided at no additional cost will include the following based on the bid request below:

4-4yd container to be serviced 1xwk per week for the City of Butler with locations at the City Barn on Depot Street, Butler Police Department on West Main Street, Hathway Park on East Willow and Maxton Park on Green Street Extended.

15-96-gallon containers for garbage service for Butler Days Festival to be held the second weekend of August each year of the contract agreement.

Washler Inc
 City of Butler Bid Sheet
 December 1, 2023

	Base Trash:	Base trash w/ 1 large item pick up per year:	Base trash w/ 2 large item pick ups per year:	Base Trash w/ 4 large item pick ups per year:	Base Trash w/ 12 Large item pick ups per year:	Base Trash w/ 24 Large item pick ups per year:
Year 1	\$ 14.07	\$ ^{.84} 14.91	\$ ^{1.69} 15.75	\$ ^{2.56} 17.43	\$ ^{10.08} 24.15	\$ 34.23
Year 2	\$ 14.50	\$ ^{.86} 15.36	\$ ^{1.73} 16.23	\$ ^{3.46} 17.96	\$ ^{10.38} 24.88	\$ 35.26
Year 3	\$ 15.08	\$ ^{.90} 15.98	\$ ^{1.80} 16.88	\$ ^{3.59} 18.67	\$ ^{10.79} 25.87	\$ 36.67
Year 4 *	\$ 15.68	\$ 16.61	\$ 17.55	\$ 19.42	\$ 26.91	\$ 38.14
Year 5 *	\$ 16.31	\$ 17.28	\$ 18.25	\$ 20.20	\$ 27.98	\$ 39.66

	Recycle:
Year 1	\$ 6.84
Year 2	\$ 7.04
Year 3	\$ 7.32
Year 4 *	\$ 7.69
Year 5 *	\$ 8.07

* Optional years if the city so desires

All City needed containers and service as specified in the bid spec is included at no additional cost

All prices are listed as price per month, per residence



Trash Pricing

Base Bid

Monthly Curbside Large Item Pickup (2 Item Max per Resident)

- Year 1 - \$13.23/Home Per Month
- Year 2 - \$13.89/Home Per Month
- Year 3 - \$14.58/Home Per Month

All pricing for municipal dumpsters and Butler Days Festival included in rate above

Semi-Monthly Curbside Large Item Pickup (2 Item Max per Resident)

- Year 1 - \$13.20/Home Per Month
- Year 2 - \$13.86/Home Per Month
- Year 3 - \$14.55/Home Per Month

All pricing for municipal dumpsters and Butler Days Festival included in rate above

Quarterly Curbside Large Item Pickup

- Year 1 – No Bid
- Year 2 – No Bid
- Year 3 – No Bid

Semi-Annual Curbside Large Item Pickup

- Year 1 – No Bid
- Year 2 – No Bid
- Year 3 – No Bid



Trash Pricing

Alternative Bid

Weekly Bulk Pickup (1 (40) yard dumpster per week staged at designated area)

- Year 1 - \$11.79/Home Per Month
- Year 2 - \$12.38/Home Per Month
- Year 3 - \$13.00/Home Per Month

All pricing for municipal dumpsters and Butler Days Festival included in rate above

Quarterly Bulk Pickup (8 (40) yard dumpster per event staged at designated area)

- Year 1 - \$11.76/Home Per Month
- Year 2 - \$12.35/Home Per Month
- Year 3 - \$12.97/Home Per Month

All pricing for municipal dumpsters and Butler Days Festival included in rate above



Recycle Pricing

Base Bid

Bi-Weekly Recycle Pickup (Contractor Provided 96 Gallon Cart)

- Year 1 - \$8.50/Home Per Month
- Year 2 - \$8.93/Home Per Month
- Year 3 - \$9.38/Home Per Month

Kirby Dunagan

Public Sector Solutions

pdunagan@wm.com

C: 502-702-4013

4636 Adams Center Rd

Fort Wayne, IN 46806